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97-1093 
CD 1 
 To Council 

Motion (Reyes - Garcetti) - That the City Council consider and adopt at its meeting of March 12, 2010 
the report to be submitted by the Bureau of Engineering, including any required Resolution and related 
documents, relative to the alley vacation for the alley easterly of Westlake Avenue from 7th Street to 
approximately 295 northerly thereof. 

 
06-2369-S11 
CD 10 
 To Planning and Land Use Management Committee 

Application submitted on March 5, 2010, relative to a Hardship Exemption from the Windsor Village 
Interim Control Ordinance 179286 for property at 1012 South Windsor Boulevard. 

 
07-1586 
 To Jobs and Business Development Committee 

City Administrative Officer report 0310-00219-0157, dated March 4, 2010, relative to film permit 
coordination services, recommended contract award. 

 
08-1301 
CD 11 
 To Housing, Community and Economic Development Committee 

Mayor report, dated March 4, 2010, relative to Commission nominee's withdrawal of Mr. Christopher D. 
Lee from the Industrial Development Authority. 

 
08-1783-S2 
 To Jobs and Business Development Committee 

Department of Transportation report, dated March 4, 2010, relative to the continuance of extending free 
use of all non-operated parking facilities to the film industry; etc. 

 
08-2225 
CD 5 
 To Planning and Land Use Management Committee 

Bureau of Engineering report, dated February 24, 2010, relative to the re-designation and downgrade of 
Overland Avenue between Pico Boulevard and Santa Monica Boulevard. 

 

09-1845 
 To Planning and Land Use Management Committee 

City Attorney report R10-0061, dated March 4, 2010, relative to previously submitted draft ordinance 
amending sections of the Los Angeles Municipal Code relating to joint living and work quarters. 

 
09-1914 
 To Council 

City Attorney report R10-0062, dated March 4, 2010, relative to a draft ordinance amending Section 
21.41 of the Los Angeles Municipal Code to address the classification of internet businesses. 
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09-2057 
 To Planning and Land Use Management Committee 

City Attorney report R10-0063, dated March 5, 2010, relative to a draft ordinance amending sections of 
the Los Angeles Municipal Code to extend the time subdivision map approvals and associated 
discretionary approvals. 

 
10-0006-S9 
CD 12 
 To Public Safety Committee 

Police Department report, dated March 3, 2010, relative to the application for Graffiti Apprehension 
Reward Payment for incident at Los Alimos and White Oak Street. 

 
10-0039 
 To Council 

Motion (Parks - Rosendahl) - Move that the settlement of the judgment in the case entitled Richard 
Dana Lee v. City of Los Angeles, et al., be amended to authorize the City Attorney to make payment 
from the previously designated source and in the previously approved amount to Law Offices of Manuel 
H. Miller and Richard Dana Lee; etc. 

 
10-0209 
CD 7 
 To Housing, Community and Economic Development Committee 

Chief Legislative Analyst report 10-02-0202, dated March 5, 2010, relative to a resolution regarding the 
Community Redevelopment Agency’s request to continue holding the property located at 13574 Foothill 
Boulevard in Sylmar for an additional five years to develop site for affordable housing. 

 
10-0370 
 To Planning and Land Use Management Committee 

Mayor report, dated March 4, 2010, relative to the appointment of Mr. Christopher D. Lee to the West 
Los Angeles Area Planning Commission for the term ending June 30, 2013.  Mr. Lee will fill the 
vacancy created by Ms. Sophia Chang, who resigned January 14, 2010. 

 
10-0377 
 To Budget and Finance Committee 

City Attorney report R10-0059, dated March 4, 2010, relative to a settlement discussion in Closed 
Session, pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(a), in the case of Frederick T. Mecozzi v. City 
of Los Angeles, et al.; etc. 

 
10-0378 
 To Arts, Parks, Health and Aging Committee 

Department of Cultural Affairs report, dated February 26, 2010, relative to the authority to accept a 
donation from the Walt Disney Company for the City's Heritage Months Celebration programs; etc. 
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10-0379 
CD 11 
 To Trade, Commerce and Tourism Committee 

Board of Airport Commissioners report, dated March 5, 2010; and City Administrative Officer report 
0150-00939-0109, dated March 4, 2010, relative to a proposed Fourth Amendment to Lease No. LAA-
1652 with Continental Airlines, Incorporated, and the Department of Airports to extend the term for an 
additional three years; etc. 

 
10-0380 
CD 10 
 To Council 

Motion (LaBonge - Wesson, Jr.) - That the Department of General Services be authorized to receive 
donation from BRE, Incorporated and to cause it to be deposited in the General Services Fund 
(Maintenance, Materials, Supplies and Services) to cover the cost of installation of carpeting at the Los 
Angeles Police Department West Traffic Division, 4849 West Venice Boulevard. 

 
10-0381 
 To Council 

Motion (Rosendahl - Parks) - That the City Council, with the concurrence of the Mayor, authorize the 
Los Angeles Department of Transportation to transfer and appropriate funds within the Proposition A 
Local Transit Fund from the Information Technology Agency Account to the Transit Bus Radio 
Automatic Vehicle Location System; etc. 

 

10-0382 
CD 4 
 To Transportation Committee 

Motion (LaBonge - Wesson, Jr.) - That the Department of Transportation report with recommendations 
for the installation of speed humps on Plymouth Street between 4th Street and 5th Street in Council 
District 4 with the understanding that all the costs associated with this installation shall be paid by 
private, non-public, sources. 
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